
Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SOYAL RAFIK MOMIN

MOMIN AALI,, RAJGURUNAGAR TAL. 
KHED, DIST. PUNE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

FYBA001    Seat No. :  81005Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : ANSARI PARVEZ SARFARAZ

RAJGURUNAGAR, TAL. KHED, DIST. PUNE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

FYBA002    Seat No. :  80956Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GAVIT SONALI DHANRAJ

SHIVYOG SOCIETY, BORGAD 
(MHASRULA), NASHIK 4

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA002    Seat No. :  52063Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MHATRE SWATI PARASHURAM

AT.POST AJIVALI, TAL. PANVEL,

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA012    Seat No. :  50634Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KHANDAGALE MADHURI MADHUKAR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA013    Seat No. :  52461Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DAHIPHALE PRASAD AMBADAS

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA014    Seat No. :  52445Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHEKADE CHAITANYA DILIP

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA015    Seat No. :  52476Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHIRSAT JYOTI DINKAR

AT. POST . PIMPALGAO. TAL. PARTHADI, 
DIST. A. NAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA016    Seat No. :  52478Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JADHAV SUNITA BABASAHEB

AT. POST. AVHANE KHU. TAL. SHEGAON. 
DIST. A. NAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA017    Seat No. :  52456Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DONGARE AVINASH MAHADEV

At/P- Bhatnimgaon,
Tal-Indapur,
Dist-Pune

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA019    Seat No. :  13968Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KAKADE PUJA BHARAT

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA020    Seat No. :  00092Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAWAR HARISHCHANDRA JAYRAM

AT POST LAKHMAPUR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA023    Seat No. :  20048Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BAGUL MANGALA KRUSHNA

AT MOKHANAL POST GANDULE TAL 
DINDORI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA024    Seat No. :  20033Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SUREKHA KARBHARI AHER

AT.POST. MAKARANDWADI
(SUBHASHNAGAR)

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA025    Seat No. :  51980Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHEWALE NITIN KEWALRAO

AT.POST. KARMAND, TAL. SATANA, DIST. 
NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA026    Seat No. :  52022Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAWAR PRIYANKA DHAGA

DAREGAON, TAL. SATANA, DIST. NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA027    Seat No. :  52015Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : CHOUDHARY MADHURI MADHUKAR

AT.POST. TAHARABAD, TAL. SATANA, 
DIST. NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA028    Seat No. :  51989Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : AHIRE SAGAR ABASAHEB

AT.POST. RATEER, TAL. SATANA, DIST. 
NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA029    Seat No. :  51981Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : VINOD SUNJAY BACHHAV

AT.POST. ABHONA VISHCHANDRA NIWAS 
,SHASTRINAGAR, ABHONA, TAL. 
KALWAN, DIST. NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA030    Seat No. :  51984Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : AHIRE SUBHASH GANGADHAR

AT. MOHANDARI, POST. NANDURI, TAL. 
KALWAN, DIST. NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA031    Seat No. :  51982Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHILPA BALASAHEB BHARTI

MAHALAKSHMINAGAR, LASALGAO, TAL. 
NIPHAD, DIST. NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA033    Seat No. :  52034Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BORUDE DATTATRAY RAMDAS

A/P-LONI HAVELI, TAL-PARNER, DIST-
AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA035    Seat No. :  22977Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : NIKULE PRASHANT DEVRAM

AT POST-PETH

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA036    Seat No. :  19773Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KANOJE GANESH ASHOK

AT-SAPATPALI POST-HARSUL TAL-
TRIMBAKESHWAR DIST-NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA037    Seat No. :  19791Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : CHAUDHARI ASHOK RAMDAS

AT-WADPADA POST-NACHLONDHI TAL-
PETH DIST-NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA038    Seat No. :  19759Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GAVIT AMOL SOMNATH

AT-SAPATPALI POST-HARSUL TAL-
TRIMBAKESHWAR DIST-NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA039    Seat No. :  19762Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KASHID PRANALI NANASAHEB

AT.POST. VELUJE, TAL. 
TRAMBAKESHWAR, DIST. NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA040    Seat No. :  19766Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : VADGE JYOTI MADHUKAR

MARUTI CHOUK IN FRONT SADHANA 
LIBRARY SANGAMESHWAR MALEGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA041    Seat No. :  17582Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PATIL VAISHALI DADAJI

AT. AJUNG, POST. WADEL, TAL. 
MALEGAON, DIST. NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA042    Seat No. :  51771Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KARMAL VIKAS DNYANESHWAR

BHAIRAV NAGAR ,DHANORI 
ROAD,VISHRANTWADI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA043    Seat No. :  13610Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : LONDHE SANJAY YESHWANT

WADGAON GUPTA ROAD SAMRAT NAGAR 
NAVNAGAPUR AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA044    Seat No. :  20525Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GUNJAL GANESH SOPAN

AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA045    Seat No. :  20561Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KASAR SUHAS CHOTU

hanmanwadi ststion road near jivala 
building mukam post chalish goan tal 
chalish goan dsit jalgoan

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA047    Seat No. :  11722Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KALIDAS DNYANESHWAR PADALGHARE

A/P-RIHE(PADALGHARWADI) TAL-MULSHI 
DIST-PUNE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA048    Seat No. :  11721Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PHAD GANGASAGAR DNYANOBA

BRAHMANALI VISHNU, NEAR MANDIR, 
RAJGURUNAGAR. PUNE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA049    Seat No. :  51209Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KAKAD SURESH SOPAN

TILAPUR, TAL. RAHURI, DIST. 
AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA050    Seat No. :  21768Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : TAMBEKAR DEVRAM BUDHA

AT.POST. MUTKHEL, TAL. AKOLE, DIST. 
A.NAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA051    Seat No. :  22840Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : WAJE VISHAL RAVINDRA

ROOM NO. 66, JAIL ROAD, NASHIK ROAD,

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA052    Seat No. :  17796Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DEOGIRE NAJUKA NARAYAN

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA053    Seat No. :  17778Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KAJAL KANIFINATH DUSUNGE

BHENDA BUDRUK, TAL. NEWASA, DIST. 
A.NAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA055    Seat No. :  22604Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : UDE PALLAVI NANASAHEB

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA056    Seat No. :  22588Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PATIL KHAGESH BALIRAM

AT POST. ZODAGE. TAL. MALEGAON, 
DIST. NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA061    Seat No. :  17361Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KULAL ASHOK DEVRAM

AT KODANI POST RANDHA

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA004    Seat No. :  21949Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KHOPADE SURESH SHANKAR

AT/POST-AMBEGHAR TAL-BHOR DIST-
PUNE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA007    Seat No. :  5415Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GHOLAP SATISH ANKUSH

A/P KARI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA008    Seat No. :  5399Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DHONDE VAIBHAV DINKAR

AT/POST-CHIKHALGAON DHONDEWADI 
TAL-BHOR DIST-PUNE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA009    Seat No. :  5391Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DEORE MANGESH SAKHARCHAND

AT POST VADGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA010    Seat No. :  10100Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : CHIKANE JITENDRA DILIP

A/P-DAHIWAL

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA011    Seat No. :  10086Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : AHIRE YOGESHWARI MADHUKAR

AP-NIMBOLA

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA015    Seat No. :  10026Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JAGTAP SARIKA NANAJI

A/P NIMBAYATI TAL MALEGAON (NASHIK)

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA016    Seat No. :  10156Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KAKLIJ SANJAY JIBHAU

AT POST SAWANDHGAON TAL 
MALEGAON DIST NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA017    Seat No. :  10167Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GAIKWAD YOGITA DAGDU

BEHIND CHURCH RAM NAGARI 
MALEGAON CAMP

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA018    Seat No. :  10122Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BORSE HIMANSHU ASHOK

A/p Sonaj

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA019    Seat No. :  17230Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PRAFULL RAJENDRA SHAKHAPAL

AT POST KASABE SUKENE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA021    Seat No. :  16946Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : NIPHADE SHRIRAM BAKERAO

A/P BHAUSAHEB NAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA025    Seat No. :  16944Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SANGALE GOVIND KHANDU

pimplas

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA028    Seat No. :  16949Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : WAGHMODE LAXMAN RAMDAS

A/P- DAHIFAL  TAL- SHEVGAON  DIST- 
AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA032    Seat No. :  20827Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHINDE SACHIN BANSI

A/P- DAHIFAL  OLD  TAL- SHEVGAON  
DIST- AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA033    Seat No. :  20816Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : CHAUGULE SAGAR ARUN

WADAR GALLI SHEVGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA034    Seat No. :  20760Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PADEKAR PRATIKSHA KAILAS

Ap Rui

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA037    Seat No. :  19350Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : LOKHANDE MAHESH KAILAS

A/P MAJNARI BK PUNE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA040    Seat No. :  4132Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GONDAKE NAVNATH SHIVRAM

A/P KARANDI TAL AKOLE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA042    Seat No. :  4099Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAWAR OMKAR NANDKISHOR

sector no-21,sch no-9,chawl no-
17/10,yamunanagr,nigdi

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA043    Seat No. :  1148Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GADILKAR DIGAMBAR SHANTARAM

AT GADILGAON POST GUNORE TAL 
PARNER DIST AHMEDNAGAR 414306

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA044    Seat No. :  18288Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SALVE AVINASH UTTAM

A/P MADHI TAL PATHARDI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA045    Seat No. :  19800Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SASANE MAHESH NANASAHEB

AT/PO. NIMBODI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA046    Seat No. :  19805Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHAIKH SOHEB DILDAR

A/P MALIBABHULGAON TAL PATHARDI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA047    Seat No. :  19810Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KHEDKAR PANKAJ SAMPAT

at-chumbhali post-takalimanur

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA049    Seat No. :  19759Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAWAR VIKAS VIJAY

AP- TAKLIBHAN

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA051    Seat No. :  18477Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : NIKAM SUNIL BHAGATSHING

AT POST ADGAON CHOTHWA TAL YEOLA 
DIST NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA053    Seat No. :  13094Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SONAWANE CHETAN JANARDHAN

AT POST NAGADE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA054    Seat No. :  13121Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : AHIRE KALPESH GOKUL

AT POST SATANA, TAL SATANA, DIST 
NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA056    Seat No. :  11394Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : TALAWARE DAULAT HIRAMAN

AT-BHIULDAR PO-JORAN

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA057    Seat No. :  11512Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KARANJULE POONAM SONAJI

PADLI, RANJANGAON. DIST. PUNE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA058    Seat No. :  80800Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : LOKHANDE SONALI JALINDAR

DEODAITHAN

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA059    Seat No. :  3431Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KALAMKAR MOHAN SUBHASH

Kalamkarwadi, Tal-Parner, Dist-
Ahmednagar

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA061    Seat No. :  3496Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : TONGARE AKSHAY NATHU

AT POST GANGAPUR GANGAVARE 
NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA063    Seat No. :  9336Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SONAWANE PRATIK GOKUL

BHONSALA MILITARY COLLEGE CAMPUS

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA064    Seat No. :  9329Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHAIKH JAVID PAPAMIYA

ABHIMANNU SOC . SHIVAJI NAGAR 
SATPUR NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA066    Seat No. :  9323Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SAYYED SAKIB MAHEMUD

jaydeep nagar wadala road nashik.

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA067    Seat No. :  9322Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : VADAK POOJA BALU

JADHAV SANKUL AMBAD LINK ROAD 
ROOM NO.451 SATPUR NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA068    Seat No. :  9338Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KORDE SURESH LAHANU

AT MAHADEVPUR POST GANGAPUR TAL 
DIST NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA070    Seat No. :  9366Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : YELMAME POOJA DATTATRAY

Ramanand Nagar, Someshwar Colony, 
Satpur, Nashik

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA072    Seat No. :  9345Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAWAR RAHUL SURESH

Ap-Kati (Yadavwadi),
Tal-Indapur,Dist-Pune,Pin-413120

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA074    Seat No. :  4556Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SURYAVANSHI YOGESH VILAS

AP- BAWADA

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA075    Seat No. :  4583Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JADHAV MAHESH RAJARAM

AP GALANDWADI NO 1

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA076    Seat No. :  4509Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SALVI SAPANA SURESH

28/636 PRADHIKARAN NIGDI PUNE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA077    Seat No. :  6638Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHAIKH ALIM AZIZ

AHILYABAI DEVI CHOUK NANDGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA078    Seat No. :  13780Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PATHAVE BARKU GANGARAM

A/P:-Savargaon pat,Tal:-Akole,Dist:-
Ahmednagar

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA082    Seat No. :  18238Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DENGALE PRASHANT ASHOK

AP-NIMGAONJALI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA084    Seat No. :  20131Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHINDE SOMNATH DATTATARY

At Post Diksali Tal Parner Dist Ahmednagar

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA091    Seat No. :  20726Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KAYASTH MAYURI BHAGIRATH

AP KAREGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA092    Seat No. :  3420Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BHANGADE MAHENDRA CHANGDEO

TAL YEOLA

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA094    Seat No. :  12782Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SWAPNIL BHAGAVAN SONAWANE

AT/POST ANDARSUL

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA095    Seat No. :  31582Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MORE SIMA PANDIT

AT POST KUPKHEDA TAL.BAGLAN

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA097    Seat No. :  14758Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : HYALIJ SEEMA DILIP

AT POST AKHATWADE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA099    Seat No. :  14611Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAWAR SADHANA ANIL

AT POST NAMPUR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA100    Seat No. :  14678Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PIMPALSE RANI DAMU

AT POST DYANE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA101    Seat No. :  14680Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHINDE AMRUTA DIGAMBAR

AT POST KOTBEL

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA102    Seat No. :  14693Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHIRSATH POONAM NANAJI

AT POST TALWADE BHAMER

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA103    Seat No. :  14694Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GANGURDE VAISHALI RAJENDRA

AT POST TEMBHE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA104    Seat No. :  14606Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : THAKARE PUNAM SUBHASH

A/P-BODHARI TAL-BAGLAN DIST-NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA105    Seat No. :  14704Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAWAR ARUN ASHOK

AT.POST. TAL. SURGANA, DIST. NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA107    Seat No. :  15294Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JADHAV NILESH KALIDAS

SHANTINAGAR, AT.POST.TAL. SURGANA, 
DIST. NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA108    Seat No. :  15375Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : WAGHMARE SUNIL HIRAMAN

AT.POST. AMBUPADA BEDASE, TAL. 
SURGANA, DIST. NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

SYBA109    Seat No. :  15332Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : NITIN ANKUSH BAMBERE

AT POST KODANI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

TYBA002    Seat No. :  22129Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KHAN AYESHA JAKIR

IUDP KHAKIBAG  MANMAD

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

TYBA004    Seat No. :  12025Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KHETMALIS SAGAR BABAN

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

TYBA005    Seat No. :  32589Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : ADHAL KAILAS DNYANDEV

hadapsar pune

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

TYBA006    Seat No. :  4211Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : AHIRE MEGHA BUDHA

At-Nandurtek Post-Wadbare Tal-Chandwad 
Dist-Nashik pin423101

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

TYBA009    Seat No. :  13305Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DIGVIJAY ANIL SHIRSATH

AP KOLHAR KD TAL RAHURI DIST 
AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

TYBA010    Seat No. :  22718Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DAS KESHAV DILIP

nanapeth pune

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

TYBA011    Seat No. :  1616Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SONAWANE SUDAM UTTAM

at post khankhed

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

TYBA013    Seat No. :  14480Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KOKTARE RESHMA RAMESH

AT TERUNGAN PO KATLAPUR TAL AKOLE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

TYBA014    Seat No. :  20476Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : AWARI RAHUL KARBHARI

AT PO DHAMNAGAON AWARI TAL AKOLE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

TYBA016    Seat No. :  20438Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAGAR KAVITA DATTU

At-Sawargaon Post-Ranawad

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

TYBA018    Seat No. :  17045Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAGAR HARSHAD RAJARAM

at/p0 - khadak ozar

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

TYBA019    Seat No. :  17044Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 388

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  13/02/2017

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KADALE SANDIP SHIVAJI

A/P- VANSAGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  08/02/2017, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  01/03/2017 at 12:00 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

TYBA020    Seat No. :  17040Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in October/November,2016


