
Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JADHAV AKSHAY RAHUL

kranti nagar,pimple gurav

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA263    Seat No. :  60396Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PATIL MEENA NAGESH

Ingawale Chowk Pimple Nilakha Pune 27

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA264    Seat No. :  60410Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : UJJWALA GOVIND GABHALE

AT POST NARODI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA265    Seat No. :  15661Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : ARCHANA ADIK PATEKAR

AT POST DIMBHE COLONY TAL 
AMBEGAON DIST PUNE 410509

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA266    Seat No. :  61382Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : ASAWALE PRAKASH VISHNU

AT KOTAMDARA POST GHODEGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA267    Seat No. :  61383Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KHAN AYESHA JAKIR

IUDP KHAKI BAGMANMAD

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA268    Seat No. :  28029Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BHAWARI SONALI KASHINATH

AT- PINGALWADI,POST - NARODI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA270    Seat No. :  15403Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SONAWANE KIRAN KACHARU

AP SHINGNAPUR KOPARGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA271    Seat No. :  45244Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BANGAD MANOHAR VISHNU

AT MULWAD POST OZARKHED

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA274    Seat No. :  35741Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BHONDAVE SOPAN MANOHAR

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA275    Seat No. :  35752Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BHOYE VITTHAL YASHWANT

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA276    Seat No. :  35790Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KADAM SAMEEER JALINDHAR

At. Post. Hingnewadi,Tel. Indapur,Dist. 
Pune.

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA277    Seat No. :  19182Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : TIDAME AMOL ATMARAM

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA278    Seat No. :  36005Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DEORE RINA SANJAY

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA279    Seat No. :  35824Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MAHALE ANKUSH JAYRAM

AT HANUMANTPADA POST SHIRSGOAN 
TAL TRIMBAKESHWAR DIST NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA280    Seat No. :  35906Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : WABALE AKSHAY DILIP

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA281    Seat No. :  81423Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : ZANZANE KEDAR SUDESH

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA282    Seat No. :  81425Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : RANJIT MOHAN MADANE

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA283    Seat No. :  81465Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GAIKWAD NILESH PRAKASH

NIMBHALE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA287    Seat No. :  44262Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GURAV RAMESHWAR PRAMOD

AT/POST-TALEGAON DIGHE TAL-
SANGAMNER DIT-AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA288    Seat No. :  54434Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SATPUTE JYOTI ROHIDAS

AT/POST-TALEGAON DIGHE TAL-
SANGAMNER DIST-AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA291    Seat No. :  54462Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KUMKAR SAGAR CHANDRABHAN

NADBRMHA SOC WARJE MALWADI PUNE 
41158

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA293    Seat No. :  7184Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GAWADE KISHOR ARUN

SR. NO. 44 HANUMAN NAGER PAUD ROAD 
KOTHRUD PUNE 411038

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA295    Seat No. :  7107Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KUSEKAR SUPRIYA SAHEBRAO

Kedgaon,Tal:Daund

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA300    Seat No. :  18552Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SUL VIKAS VAMAN

Anadhalgaon,Tal:Shirur

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA301    Seat No. :  18670Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PATHARE SHITAL NAMDEO

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA304    Seat No. :  25501Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BACHHAV ASHA SANJAY

OMKAR COLONY,COLLECTOR 
ZONE,MALEGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA305    Seat No. :  25380Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KADAM VAISHALI MOTHABHAU

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA307    Seat No. :  25455Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : WAGH SWATI PRABHAKAR

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA308    Seat No. :  25568Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAWAR PRIYANKA SANTOSH

PARSHWNATH NAGAR,SOYGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA309    Seat No. :  25519Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KURAL VISHAL BANDU

AT.POST. LAKHAMAPURI TAL.SHEVGAON 
DIST.AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA310    Seat No. :  51213Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHINDE SHASHIKANT SURESH

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA311    Seat No. :  4782Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : TARU KALPESH MOHAN

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA312    Seat No. :  81041Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : UBHE TUSHAR BABAN

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA313    Seat No. :  4786Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KUNDE BHIMA YASHWANT

AT NINAVI POST PIMALGAONDUKARA 
TAL IGATPURI DSIT NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA316    Seat No. :  21992Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BONGE UDDHAV SUDAM

GANGOTRI VIHAR AMRUTDHAM 
PANCHVATI NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA318    Seat No. :  21945Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KOTHARE TAI ARJUN

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA320    Seat No. :  53861Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SULLI ROHAN SANJAY

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA322    Seat No. :  5395Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : POOJA GANGADHAR SONAWANE

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA323    Seat No. :  63888Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : NILIMA KESHAV BHAMARE

AT POST SOMPUR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA324    Seat No. :  63885Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MALI SINDHU HIRAMAN

AT WADIPISOL POST JAIKHEDA

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA326    Seat No. :  36690Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BACHHAV KAMLAKAR UTTAMRAO

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA330    Seat No. :  30173Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JAGTAP KALPANA SITARAM

AT VANJARI POST ABHONA TAL KALWAN 
DIST NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA331    Seat No. :  36343Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : RAUT DHANRAJ RAMDAS

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA332    Seat No. :  36390Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BANGAL SUNITA RAMESH

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA333    Seat No. :  36254Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : CHOUDHARI ABHJIT VASANT

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA346    Seat No. :  14207Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SAMBHERAO SANJAY SHRIKANT

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA348    Seat No. :  14258Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MALGE VYANKTESH KISHOR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA349    Seat No. :  14240Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : THOKE UMESH SURESH

AP-AGHAR BK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA353    Seat No. :  38787Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SONULE MANGESH GANPAT

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA354    Seat No. :  50588Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : THOKE BHUSHAN BALIWAN

AP-AGHAR BK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA358    Seat No. :  38786Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MARKAD RAVINDRA BALASAHEB

AP KASALI TAL KOPARGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA359    Seat No. :  45184Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : WAGH SUNIL LAXMAN

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA360    Seat No. :  45258Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : THORAT SWAPNIL KISHOR

A/P KORHALE TAL.RAHATA 
DIST.AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA362    Seat No. :  45249Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KURHE KAPIL RAVINDRA

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA363    Seat No. :  45169Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KURHE PANKAJ DIGAMBAR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA365    Seat No. :  45170Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JADHAV RAJENDRA SITARAM

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA366    Seat No. :  45149Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JAMDHADE SANDIP BHAUSAHEB

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA367    Seat No. :  45151Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : HAGAVANE AKSHAY VIJAY

AT POST GIRAWALI TAL AMBEGAON DIST 
PUNE PIN 412408

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA368    Seat No. :  15430Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : ERANDE VIKAS ASHOK

AT POST CHAS

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA371    Seat No. :  15414Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : CHAVARE TEJAS KALIDAS

KALEWADI PHATA SHREEKRISHNA 
COLLONY THERGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA376    Seat No. :  5845Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : LOHOT VIVEK BALASAHEB

AT POST GANGAPUR BK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA379    Seat No. :  15474Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : ERANDE VIKAS ASHOK

AT POST CHAS

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA384    Seat No. :  15414Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : WALKOLI MOHINI JANKU

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA385    Seat No. :  82766Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MAHAMUNI SACHIN VILAS

GHARGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA392    Seat No. :  53927Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KHEDEKAR SUHAS TUKARAM

Ghargaon

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA393    Seat No. :  53923Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KUNGAR VIKAS DATTATRAYA

GHARGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA394    Seat No. :  53862Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KOTHARE TAI ARJUN

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA395    Seat No. :  53861Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KATORE RAHUL ASHOK

ghargaon

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA396    Seat No. :  53853Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JADHAV PRAVIN SHANKAR

GHARGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA397    Seat No. :  53845Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GHOGARE SACHIN RAJU

GHARGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA398    Seat No. :  53837Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : ZENDE AKSHAYKUMAR BALASAHEB

ghargaon

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA399    Seat No. :  53989Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : LOKHANDE TUSHAR JAYSING

Ghargaon

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA400    Seat No. :  53972Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BHOSALE JAVAD FAILYA

GHARGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA401    Seat No. :  53943Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JAGATAP KIRAN BABURAO

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA408    Seat No. :  65180Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MASARE ASHA JANGALU

At Post Rahuri Tal Rahuri Dist Ahmednagar

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA409    Seat No. :  48331Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KARANDE AKSHAY RAJENDRA

A/P - Khadambe KD

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA410    Seat No. :  48053Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : WAGH SAGAR MADAN

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA412    Seat No. :  48169Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : NAVALE PRADIP BAJRANG

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA414    Seat No. :  43518Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SUPEKAR AJAY CHHABU

a/p kopargaon

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA415    Seat No. :  44928Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SABLE AKASH RAJU

A/P KOPARGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA416    Seat No. :  44925Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : WAJE ANIL KUNDALIK

AT POST PANGARI TAL AKOLE DIST 
AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA417    Seat No. :  66010Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KHOTARE KESHAV NIVRUTTI

AT HIRDI POST ROHILE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA419    Seat No. :  37110Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BHOGE NANDA BABURAO

AT/POST-RANWAD

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA420    Seat No. :  39276Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAGAR KAVITA DATTU

A/P-SAVARGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA421    Seat No. :  39298Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BAGUL RINA ASHOK

RANWAD

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA422    Seat No. :  39257Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : CHAUDHARI NIRANJAN SURESH

AT POST AMBE TAL PETH DIST NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA426    Seat No. :  35478Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KALUNKE MANOJ MAHADEV

Sr No-76/77,Siddharth Nagar,Padmavti 
Pune-09

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA427    Seat No. :  3503Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SATHE SAMEER BALU

taljai mata vasahat padmavati pune-09

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA434    Seat No. :  3554Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GAWANDHE MEGHARAJ SAHEBRAO

AT.POST.CHACHDGAO TEL DINDORI DIST 
NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA437    Seat No. :  63738Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BHUSARE JAISHREE KANTILAL

AT. PHANASPADA POST KOPURALI BK 
TAL PETH DIST NASHIK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA438    Seat No. :  35473Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PANSARE SAMBHAJI DATTATARAY

AT.PSOT.BHAUL

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA439    Seat No. :  15322Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHINDE MACCHINDRA DILIP

AT.PSOT.CHAKAN,KHANDOBAMAL,

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA440    Seat No. :  15329Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHINDE MACCHINDRA DILIP

AT.PSOT.CHAKAN,KHANDOBAMAL,

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA441    Seat No. :  15329Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MORE SHAILESH SANJAY

BARABHABALI AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA447    Seat No. :  27481Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GODAMBE REVAN DILIP

AT GODAMBEWADI PO GHOTAWADE TAL 
MULSHI DIST PUNE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA449    Seat No. :  7706Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SANGALE NAVNATH RAGHU

AT KHUBAWALI,POST BHADAS,TAL 
MULSHI,DIST PUNE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA450    Seat No. :  7755Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : NAIK RAM RAMESH

A/P CHAPADGAON TAL-SHEVGAON DIST- 
AHMEDNAGAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA451    Seat No. :  51221Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PINGAT VAIBHAV SOMNATH

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA453    Seat No. :  19431Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PRIYANKA POPAT LANDAGE

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA454    Seat No. :  19433Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : POTE RUSHIKESH ASHOK

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA457    Seat No. :  19432Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JADHAV BALKRISHNA POPAT

AT POST-SHIROLI ( BORI ),TAL-
JUNNAR,DIST-PUNE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA458    Seat No. :  19419Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KAZI GULNAZ HAFIZUDDIN

durani complex,flat no-h-12,Mitha 
nagar,Kondhwa khurd

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA459    Seat No. :  7982Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : TAMBE ADITYA BHAUSAHEB

AP. ASTAGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA464    Seat No. :  51024Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : LOHARE RAVINDRA ULHAS

AT PO- MALEGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA465    Seat No. :  54327Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DAGALE VIJAYA BHORU

AT- DEVACHIWADI
PO- KHED

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA466    Seat No. :  54189Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : VISHAL SURESH BELOTE

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA468    Seat No. :  87972Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SATHE SANKET AHILU

A/P-HANGA

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA469    Seat No. :  47343Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : RAUT SANKET KASHINATH

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA472    Seat No. :  82265Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PANCHASHILA SURESH DETHE

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA474    Seat No. :  65483Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : AHIRE SAGAR DEVIDAS

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA475    Seat No. :  33210Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : VILAS VISHWAS KHAIRNAR

AT POST NAMPUR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA477    Seat No. :  33535Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAWAR ANITA RAJENDRA

AT POST WAGHLE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA478    Seat No. :  33516Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PUNAM VIJAY THAKARE

AT POST SHRIPURWADE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA479    Seat No. :  63443Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DEORE PRAMOD NIVRUTTI

AT POST SARDE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA480    Seat No. :  33436Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : AHIRE ARVIND ASHOK

a/p vadanear tal malegaon dis nashik

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA481    Seat No. :  33428Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : WAGH SUVARNA YUVRAJ

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA482    Seat No. :  33424Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : THOKE PUNAM BHARATSING

AT POST DEOLANE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA483    Seat No. :  33413Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BHALERAO NILESH GIRIDHAR

A/P:-MALEGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA484    Seat No. :  33231Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : AHIRE ASHABAI DIGAMBAR

AT POST VADNER

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA488    Seat No. :  33203Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KHAIRNAR ARCHANA GANPAT

DABHADI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA493    Seat No. :  38740Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAWAR GANESH DEVRAM

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA497    Seat No. :  35947Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KONDE AKSHAY SAMPAT

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA500    Seat No. :  15695Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : INGULKAR SHRINIVAS ANANTRAO

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA501    Seat No. :  15682Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : INGULKAR SHRINIVAS ANANTRAO

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA502    Seat No. :  15682Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MOKASHE PUNDLIK TUKARAM

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA503    Seat No. :  35720Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : HULGE PALLAVI AJINATH

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA505    Seat No. :  80197Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KADAKNE GEETABAI NEMCHAND

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA506    Seat No. :  82423Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : INGALE SHREYAS RAJENDRA

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA507    Seat No. :  80203Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JAGDALE ANITA TANAJI

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA508    Seat No. :  80217Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JAGTAP POOJA PARMESHWAR

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA509    Seat No. :  80218Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GAJE DATTATRAYA GORAKSH

--

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA513    Seat No. :  54574Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : TAVARE MANDA DNYANU

AT PIMPLOLI POST KAMSHET

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA514    Seat No. :  19772Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JAWALIKAR NARENDRA VISHWANATH

AT JAMBHUL POST KANHE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA519    Seat No. :  61813Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : YEWALE KIRAN SUDAM

A/P SATE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA525    Seat No. :  19817Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : TIKONE CHAITRALEE DATTATARAYA

AT KHAMSHET POST KAMSHET

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA526    Seat No. :  19774Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JADHAV VIKAS SHAHAJI

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA527    Seat No. :  5907Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : NAWALE EKNATH MURLIDHAR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

BA529    Seat No. :  54057Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GODBOLE MANISHA BHIMRAO

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA002    Seat No. :  51503Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : ANANDE KAILAS

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA003    Seat No. :  15284Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : POPASBHAT KULDEEP ARUN

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA008    Seat No. :  11978Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DHOTRE CHANCHAL RAMKRUSHNA

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA010    Seat No. :  51463Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KUMBHAR ASHWINI PRAKASH

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA011    Seat No. :  51607Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KALE VIDULA KAPIL

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA012    Seat No. :  51560Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SOMNATH BABAJI KARANDE

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA013    Seat No. :  51572Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GHULE KOMAL BHAUSAHEB

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA014    Seat No. :  51501Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MALUNGE VIKI PRAKASH

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA015    Seat No. :  51618Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KANE SANDIP AANANDA

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA016    Seat No. :  53011Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BALSARAF VAIBHAV MAHADEO

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA017    Seat No. :  53069Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : HIRE RAJENDRA BALIRAM

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA018    Seat No. :  19524Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GOSAVI PRIYANKA RAJGIR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA019    Seat No. :  19486Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BALE SUVARNA GAJANAN

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA022    Seat No. :  53090Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : NAGULPELLI ANITA JANAKRAJ

B-4/11,Udyog Nagar,Chinchwad,Pune 411 0
-27

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA023    Seat No. :  14761Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GAWALI UTTAM RAMDAS

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA028    Seat No. :  57452Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KHOTARE DEEPALI KASHINATH

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA029    Seat No. :  57455Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MAHALE SANDIP DATTU

AT POST JATEGAON BK

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA030    Seat No. :  19161Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PATIL NILIMA KARBHARI

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA031    Seat No. :  00544Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : AHER PRASAD MADHUKAR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA032    Seat No. :  56307Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : NAGESH KASHINATH HARISHCHANDRA

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA033    Seat No. :  56376Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MALI SHANTARAM RAJARAM

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA034    Seat No. :  56332Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PATIL CHHAYA JIBHAU

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA035    Seat No. :  56381Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MAHALE MEGHA DILIP

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA036    Seat No. :  56331Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PATIL SNEHA SUBHASH

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA038    Seat No. :  56385Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KAKLIJ YOGESH PUNDLIK

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA039    Seat No. :  57046Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PATIL DHANSHRI RAJENDRA

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA040    Seat No. :  57036Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHETE SUVIDHA VITTHAL

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA041    Seat No. :  59335Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KRISHNA ONKAR LANDGE

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA044    Seat No. :  56652Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : WAKCHAURE PRAVIN BALASAHEB

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA045    Seat No. :  56944Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : JADHAV NITIN RAJENDRA

yeola

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA046    Seat No. :  18211Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SURYAVANSHI MAHARUDRA BALBHIM

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA047    Seat No. :  51234Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : TALANE NIRMALA DIGAMBAR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA048    Seat No. :  51246Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BADAKH SANDIP HARIBHAU

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA050    Seat No. :  58944Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : VAKTE SAVITA VAMAN

AP BRAMHANGAON TAL KOPARGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA051    Seat No. :  21564Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DUDE JAYA SAMPAT

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA056    Seat No. :  53036Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHITOLE VAIBHAV BALASAHEB

AT.POST. BHANGAON

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA059    Seat No. :  22708Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHIPALKAR AKSHAY DILIP

AT. POST. GAR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA060    Seat No. :  22676Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BIRUTE AMOL PANNULAL

A/P WARKHED

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA065    Seat No. :  22916Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KULKARNI SANTOSH LAXMIKANT

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA067    Seat No. :  00094Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : HANDAL ANKUSH BHAUSAHEB

AT-ADGAONPOST-MIRI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA069    Seat No. :  21828Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SARODE DEVIDAS BABAN

MOHARI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA070    Seat No. :  21833Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : AVHAD SANDIP SUKHADEV

at wadule khurd post wagholi

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA073    Seat No. :  21824Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : ANIL SAHEBRAO GADEKAR

Shevgaon

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA074    Seat No. :  21823Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : AUTI BHARATI HARIBHAU

SHIRAL CHICHONDI

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA075    Seat No. :  21761Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KALE SAGAR LAXMAN

A/P TAKALIMANUR

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA077    Seat No. :  21781Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KEDAR PRIYANKA PRABHAKAR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA084    Seat No. :  59019Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : ITHAPE SOMEENATH RAMNATH

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA085    Seat No. :  58892Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GORE RAMBHAU BANSI

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA086    Seat No. :  58998Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : GHODASE MACHHINDRADATTU

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA087    Seat No. :  58996Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DHAKANE SUNITA DINKAR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA089    Seat No. :  58983Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : CHOPADA PAVANKUMAR POPATLAL

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA090    Seat No. :  58969Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : CHEMATE AJINATH SUDHAKAR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA091    Seat No. :  58967Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BHOSALE GEETA VITTHAL

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA092    Seat No. :  58962Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : BHAVAR AMOL PARMESHWAR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA093    Seat No. :  58875Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHINALKAR BHAUSAHEB GURUNATH

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA094    Seat No. :  55242Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHIMPI SHEKHAR SHANTARAM

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA096    Seat No. :  57317Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : DHUMSE DATTATREY PRABHAKAR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA098    Seat No. :  57469Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : WARODE RAKHI GORAKH

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA099    Seat No. :  59097Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : TAMBE RAMESHWAR LAXMAN

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA100    Seat No. :  59089Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SONAWANE RATNMALA HARIBHAU

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA102    Seat No. :  59084Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHIRSAT KIRAN PADMAKAR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA103    Seat No. :  59080Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHINDE BHUJANG GANGADHAR

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA104    Seat No. :  58925Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : ROKADE YOGESH BIMRAO

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA106    Seat No. :  59065Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PAWAR DILIP DNYANOBA

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA107    Seat No. :  58917Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PATHAN SIDDHIQUE ZAMEER

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA109    Seat No. :  58915Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : PANDHARE RAMDAS MARUTI

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA110    Seat No. :  59052Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : NITAL BHAGWAN BHAUSAHEB

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA111    Seat No. :  58909Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : LANDE MANISHA KAKASAHEB

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA113    Seat No. :  59029Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KHEDKAR AMOL GAHININATH

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA114    Seat No. :  59105Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : MALI BABASAHEB BHORU

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA115    Seat No. :  59690Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : KHEDKAR YOGESH SURESH

AT POST JAIKHEDA

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA116    Seat No. :  19535Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : YEOLE HEMANGINI HIRALAL

A/P. RAJMANE

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA117    Seat No. :  16930Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016



Ref. No.:Exam/Certi/U.F./ 291

               EXAMINATION DEPARTMENT
               Certificate Section (Unfair means)
               Ganeshkhind,PUNE-7,INDIA
               Phone: (020)25601207/17

Date :  16/09/2016

Encl : as above

Yours Faithfully

For Controller of Examinations

(Note - Please refer circular No.218 of 1997 and contact Principal of your college for provisional 
admission & submission of examination form etc.)

Shri/Smt : SHIRSAT GORAKSHA MAHADEV

-

STUDENT COPY

Note:Forwarded through Principal with stamp

Ref - Show Cause Notice No.------, dated-------

Sir/Madam,

              You were asked is remain present before the Enquiry Committee appointed for the purpose of 
investigating cases of unfair means resorted to by the student,held on  31/08/2016, vide the Show 
Cause Notice under reference. However,you failed to appear before the Committee on the said date.

               Now the next meeting of the committee is scheduled to be held on  22/09/2016 at 12:30 pm  
in the office of the University and you have been provided one more opportunity to apper before the 
said Committee in your defence on the day, time and place fixed for the meeting, along with your 
written explanation (as per the enclosed format) to the above referred Show Cause Notice.

              You should also bring your examination Hall Ticket and College Identity Card. If you fail to 
appear before Committee, it will be presumed that you have nothing to say in this matter and the 
Committee will take decision in your case in absentia, on the basis of the available 
evidence/documents, which shall be binding on you.

MA119    Seat No. :  59078Case No. :

Subject- Notice (under clause 10(vi) of Ordinance 09)in respect of Unfair means at the University 
Examination held in March/April,2016


